CITY OF SOUTH BEND, INDIANA
CONTRACTOR'’S BID FOR PUBLIC WORK

Project Name 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid

Project No. 126-015

For Bids Due April 14, 2026, 9:00 a.m., Local Time

PART |
(Must be completed for all bids. Please type or print)
Date: April 14, 2026 Bidder (Firm): _Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

Address: 25200 State Road 23

City/State/Zip: South Bend, IN 46614  Telephone Number: ( 574-) 288-8321

Agent of Bidder (if Applicable):  Jacob K. Kwilasz - Area Manager

Pursuant to notices given, the undersigned offers to furnish labor and/or material necessary to complete the
public works project of:

2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid

the City of South Bend, Indiana, in accordance with plans and specifications prepared by:
City of South Bend Department of Public Works Division of Engineering

and dated N/A for the sum of (enter the Total Bid as shown on the Proposal)
Refer +o Themized B Tacm $ ee Bd
(Enter sum of Division shown on Proposal) (Numerical)

The undersigned further agrees to furnish a bond or certified check with this bid for an amount specified in
the notice of the letting. If alternative bids apply, the undersigned submits a proposal for each in accordance
with the notice. Any addendums attached will be specifically referenced at the applicable page.

If additional units of material included in the contract are needed, the cost of units must be the same as that
shown in the original contract if accepted by the City of South Bend. If the bid is to be awarded on a unit
basis, the itemization of the units shall be shown on a separate attachment.

By

sz - Area Manager
(Printed Name of Person Signing)

ACCEPTANCE
The above bid is accepted this day of 20
Subject to the following conditions:
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS
Elizabeth A. Maradik, President Joseph R. Molnar, Vice President
Murray L. Miller, Member Breana N. Micou, Member
Abigail E. Magas, Member Attest: Hillary R. Horvath, Clerk
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BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SOUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Sireet & Sewer Material Bid

Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2026, 9:00 a.m., Local Time
Contractor Name: Rjsth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.
This bid will be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder for each line item or Division, dependent on the
needs of the Gity of South Bend. The Contractor doas not need to supply unit prices for all items in each
Division to be eligible for award.
DIVISION A - PCC MATERIALS

ltam Estimated
No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price

A-1 Class A Concrete 2500 cY $ NOBID

A-2 | Class A High Early 800 CcY $ NO BID

A-3 | 7 Bag Mix 600 cY $ NO BID

A-4 | High Early Concrete w/ Integral Color - Black 650 cYy $ NO BID

A-5 Flowable Fill, Removable 350 cY $ NO BID

A6 (IJ\I.%Q/;ChIorlde Accelerator added to concrete ~ 305 EACY | § NO BID

A-7 | Non-Chloride Accelerator added to concrete — 1% 1000 EACY | $ NO BID

A-8 Non-Chloride Accelerator added to concrete — 2% 2100 EACY % NO BID
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BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SOUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid
Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2026, 2:00 a.m., Local Time

Contractor Name: Rjeth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

DIVISION B - AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Item Estimated

No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
B-1 | No. 23 Sand 5000 TON |$ 19.00
B-2 | No. 53 Gravel 1000 TON |$ NO BID
B-3 No. 53 Recycled Concrete 7500 TON $ NO BID
B-4 | No.53 Slag 1000 TON |$% NO BID
B-5 Topsuil 700 TON $ NO BID
B-6 No. 11 Slag Chip Stone 1000 TON $ NO BID

DIVISION C - SEWER MATERIALS - CASTINGS

ltem Estimated
No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
Manhole Cover and Frame: EJ 1040A, Neenah R-
-1 1642, or approved equal {Circle One) 100 EA $ NO BID
Catch Basin Cover & Frame: EJ 1020-M1, Neenah
C-2 R-1648, or approved squal {Circle One) 100 EA b NG BID

Version 07/19/2023 Centractor's Bid for Public Works - 8




BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SQUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid
Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2028, 9:00 a.m,, L.ocal Time
Contractor Name: Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

DIVISION D - SEWER MATERIALS

item Estimated

No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
D-1 | MH Riser 20 3/4" D - 1"R ~ 7/8"L 40 EA $ NO BID
D-2 | MH Riser 20 3/4" D ~ 1 1/2"R - 7/8"L. 40 EA $ NO BID
D-3 | MH Riser 20 3/4" D - 2'R - 7/8"L 20 EA $ NO BID
D-4 | MH Riser 20 3/4" D — 2 1/2'R - 7/8"L. 10 EA $ NO BID
D-5 | MH Riser 21 3/4"D - 1'"R — 1 3/8’L. 20 EA $ NO BID
D-6 | MH Riser 21 3/4"D -1 1/2°R - 1 3/8"L. 30 EA $ NO BID
D-7 | MH Riser 21 3/4” D —2"R — 1 3/8'"L 30 EA $ NO BID
D-8 | MH Riser 22 1/8"D - 2"R — 1 1/4"L. 20 EA $ NO BID
D-9 | MH Riser22 1/8”D—-3"R—1 1/4"L 20 EA $ NO BID
D-10 | MH Riser 22 1/4” D — "R — 1 1/2'L 30 EA | NO BID
D-11 | MH Riser 22 1/4" D — 1 1/2'R— 1 1/2’L 30 EA | $ NO BID
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BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SOUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid
Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2028, 9:00 a.m,, Local Time
Contractor Name: Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

DIVISION D - SEWER MATERIALS - CONTINUED

Item Estimated

No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
D-12 | MH Riser 23" D — 1"R — 1 3/4"L 30 EA $ NO BID
D-13 | MH Riser 23" D~ 1 1/2°R — 1 3/4°L 20 EA $ NO BID
D-14 | MH Riser 23" D~ 2"R—1 3/4'L 40 EA $ NO BID
D-15 | MH Riser 235/8'D~1 1/2’R -1 1/8°L 10 EA $ NO BID
D-16 | MH Riser 23 5/8"D-2"R -1 1/8"L 10 EA $ NO BID -
D-17 | MH Riser 23 5/8" D~ 1"R — 1 1/2'L 20 EA  |$ NO BID
D-18 | MHRiser236/8"D~11/2"R-11/2"L 25 EA $ NO BID
D-19 | MHRIiser 23 6/8"D-2"R -1 1/2"L 20 EA $ NO BID
D-20 MH Riser 23 5/8" D -2 1/2"R - 1 1/2"L 20 EA $ NO BID
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BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SOUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Street 8 Sewer Material Bid
Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2026, 9:00 a.m., Local Time

Contractor Name: Rjeth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

DIVISION E - TRAFFIC MATERIALS

Item Estimated
No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
High Build Fast Dry Waterborne Traffic Marking
BT | paint~ White 2200 GAL  1$  NOBID
High Build Fast Dry Waterborne Traffic Marking
E-2 1 Paint- Yellow 2200 GAL |8 NO BID
High Build Fast Dry Waterborne Traffic Marking
B3 | paint~ Blue 50 GAL |$ NO BID
High Build Fast Dry Waterborne Traffic Marking
B4 | Paint- Green 50 GAL 1%  NOBID
E-5 Pavement Marking Beads, Standard 40000 LBS $ NO BID
DIVISION F - SNOW REMOVAL MATERIALS
ltem Estimated
No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
F-1 | Beet Juice Concentrate 20,000 GAL |$ NO BID
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BID/PROPOSAL
CITY OF SOUTH BEND

Project Name: 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid
Project Number: 126-015
For Bids Due: April 14, 2026, 9:00 a.m., Local Time

Contractor Name: Rjsth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

DIVISION G — STREET MATERIALS

ltem Estimated

No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price
G-1 AE-T Tack 25,000 GAL $ NO BID
G-2 R3-2 25,000 GAL $ NO BID
G-3 | Crack Sealant 72,000 LBS $ NO BID

Bidder (Firm):  Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.
Address: 25200 State Road 23

City/State/Zip:  South Bend, IN 46614 Telephone Number:  { 574-) 288-8321

v

e (Sigpatgfer—""

o
Jacob K. Kwilasz - Area Manager

(Printed Name of Persen Signing)
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CITY OF SOUTH BEND, INDIANA
CONTRACTOR’S BID FOR PUBLIC WORK
CHECKLIST FOR BIDDERS

Project Name 2026 Street & Sewer Material Bid
Project No. 126-015
For Bids Due April 14, 2026, 9:00 a.m., Local Time

From time to time the South Bend Board of Public Works finds it necessary to reject a bid because
it does not comply with statutory requirements. In preparing your bid, please use the following
checklist in order to make sure that your bid is done in the proper manner.

N/A Proper bid security included. The bidder has the option of providing either a Certified Check
or Bid Bond. NOT REQUIRED

Bid prepared on the City of South Bend Contractor’s Bid for Public Work Form, completely
X executed.

Contractor's Non-Collusion and Non-Debarment Affidavit, Certification Regarding
Investments with Iran, Employment Eligibility Verification, Non-Discrimination Commitment,
X and Certification of use of United States Steel Products or Foundry Products.

Proof of M/WBE Utilization Plans [MBE-1.0 and WBE-1.0]. Also provide Evidence of Good
Faith Efforts Forms [MBE-2.0 and WBE-2.0] and M/WBE Contacted Forms [MBE-2.1 and
N/A WBE-2.1]. NOT REQUIRED

X Acknowledge Receipt of N/A _ Addendum(s) included with the bid.

.4 All required additional information is included with the bid.

Proposal statements and other affidavits all signed by the proper party with name either
printed or typed underneath signature.

This checklist submitted with the Bid.

<K

This checklist is provided for bidder’'s use in assuring compliance with required
documentation; however, it does not include all specifications requirements and does not
relieve the bidder of the need to read and comply with the specifications.

Bidder: Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. Date: April 14, 2026

By Authorized Representative:

Signature: %y
Print Name & TWb K. Kwilasz -
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PART i
(For projects of $100,000 or more — IC 36-1-12-4)

These statements to be submitted under oath by each bidder with and as part of his/her/its bid.
Attach additional pages for each section as needed.
SECTION | EXPERIENCE QUESTIONNAIRE

1. Attach information regarding projects your organization has completed for the period of one
(1) year prior to the date of the current bid.

2. Attach a listing of public works projects currently in process of construction by your
organization.

3. Attach information regarding any failure to complete any work awarded to you and the
location thereof.

4. Attach references from private firms for which you have performed work.

SECTION Il PLAN AND EQUIPMENT QUESTIONNAIRE

1. Afttach an explanation of your plan or layout for performing proposed work. (Examples could
inciude a narrative of when you could begin work, complete the project, number of workers,
etc. and any other information which you helieve would enable the City of South Bend to
cansider your bid.)

2. Aftach alisting of the names and addresses of all subcontractors (i.e. persons or firms outside
your own firm who have performed part of the work) that you have used on public works
projects during the past five (5) years along with a brief description of the work done by each
subcontractor.

3. If you intend to sublet any portion of the work, attach the name and address of each
subcontractor, equipment to be used by the subcontractor, and whether you will require a
bond. However, if you are unable to currently provide a listing, please understand a listing
must be provided prior to contract approval. Until the completion of the proposed project, you
are under a continuing obligation to immediately notify the City of South Bend in the event that
you subsequently determine that you will use a subcontractor on the proposed project.

4. Attach a listing of equipment you have available to use for the proposed project.

5. Have you entered into contracts or received offers for all materials which substantiate the
prices used in preparing your proposal? If not, attach an explanation for the rationale used
which would corroborate the prices listed.

SECTION [l CONTRACTOR’S FINANCIAL STATEMENT

Attachment of bidder's financial statement is mandatory. Any bid submitted without said
financial statement as required by statute shall thereby be rendered invalid. The financial
statement provided hereunder to the City of South Bend awarding the contract must be specific
enough in detail so that said City of South Bend can make a proper determination of the bidder's
capability for completing the project if awarded.
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When the prospective Contractor is unable to certify to any of the statements below, it shall attach an explanation to this Affidavit.

CONTRACTOR’S NON-COLLUSION AND NON-DEBARMENT AFFIDAVIT, CERTIFICATION
REGARDING INVESTMENT WITH IRAN, EMPLOYMENT ELIGIBILITY VERIFICATION, NON-
DISCRIMINATION COMMITMENT AND CERTIFICATION OF USE OF UNITED STATES STEEL

PRODUCTS OR FOUNDRY PRODUCTS

(Must be completed for all quotes and bids. Please type or print)

STATE OF _ INDIANA )
)88
ST. JOSEPH COUNTY )

The undersigned Contractor, being duly sworn upon his/her/its oath, affirms under the penalties of perjury
that:

1. Contractor has notf, nor has any other member, representative, or agent of the firm, company,
corporation or partnership represented by him, entered into any combination, collusion or agreement with
any person relative to the price to be bid by anyone at such letiing nor to prevent any person from bidding
nor to induce anyone to refrain from bidding, and that this bid is made without reference to any other bid and
without any agreement, understanding or combination with any other person in reference to such bidding,
Contractor further says that no person or persons, firms, or corporation has, have or will receive directly or
indirectly, any rebate, fee, gift, commission or thing of value on account of such sale; and

2. Contractor certifies by submission of this proposal that neither contractor nor any of its principals
are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from
participation in this transaction by any Federal department or agency; and

3. Contractor has not, nor has any successor to, nor an affiliate of, Contractor, engaged in
investment activities in Iran.

a. For purposes of this Certification, “Iran” means the government of Iran and any agency
or instrumentality of Iran, or as otherwise defined at Ind. Code § 5-22-16.5-5, as
amended from time-to-time.

b. As provided by Ind. Code § 5-22-16.5-8, as amended from time-to-time, a Contractor
is engaged in investment activities in Iran if either:

i. Contractor, its successor or its affiliate, provides goods or services of twenty
million dollars ($20,000,000) or more in value in the energy sector of Iran;
or

ii. Contractor, its successor or its affiliate, is a financial institution that extends
twenty million dollars ($20,000,000) or more in credit to another person for
forty-five (45) days or more, if that person will (i) use the credit to provides
goods and services in the energy sector in Iran; and (ii) at the time the
financial institution extends credit, is a person identified on list published by
the Indiana Department of Administration.

4. Contractor does not knowingly employ or contract with an unauthorized alien, nor retain any
employee or contract with a person that the Contracior subsequently learns is an unauthorized alien,
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Contractor agrees that he/she/it shall enroll in and verify the work eligibility status of all of Contractor’s
newly hired employees through the E-Verify Program as defined by 1.C. 22-5-1.7-3. Contractor’s
documentation of enrollment and participation in the E-Verify Program is included and attached as part of
this bid/quote; and

5. Contractor shall require his/her/its subcontractors performing work under this public contract to
certify that the subcontractors do not knowingly employ or contract with an unauthorized alien, nor retain
any employee or contract with a person that the subcontractor subsequently learns is an unauthorized alien,
and that the subcontractor has enrolled in and is participating in the E-Verify Program. The Contractor agrees
to maintain this certification throughout the term of'the contract with the City of South Bend, and understands
that the City may terminate the contract for default if the Coniractor fails to cure a breach of this provision
no later than thirty (30) days after being notified by the City,

6. Persons, firms, partnerships, corporations, associations, or joint venturers awarded a contract by the
City of South Bend through its agencies, boards, or comumissions shall not discriminate against any employee
or applicant for employment in the performance of a City contract with respect to hire, tenure, terms,
conditions, or privileges of contract or employment, or any matter directly or indirectly related to contracting
or employment because of race, sex, religion, color, national origin, ancesiry, gender expression, gender
identity, sexual orientation, or due to age or disability that does not affect that person’s ability to perform the
work.

In awarding contracts for the purchase of work, labor, services, supplies, equipment, materials, or any
combination of the foregoing including, but not limited to, public works contracts awarded under public
bidding laws or other contracts in which public bids are not required by law, the City, its agencies, boards,
or commissions will consider the Contractor’s good faith efforts to obtain participation by those
subcontractors certified by the State of Indiana as a Minority Business (“MBE”) or as a Women’s Business
Enterprise (“WBE”) as a factor in determining the lowest, responsible, responsive bidder.

Contractors seeking the award of a City contract cannot be required to award a subcontract to an MWBE;
however, they may not unlawfully discriminate against said MBE/WBE. On goal-gligible contracts,
Contractors are required to either meet both MBE and WBE utilization goals or demonstrate that the
Contractor has made good faith efforts to obtain participation from MBE and WBE subcontractors. A finding
of noncompliance or a discriminatory practice shall prohibit that Contractor from being awarded a City
contract for a period of one (1) vear from the date of such determination, and such determination may also
be grounds for terminating the contact to which the discriminatory practice or noncompliance pertains.

7. The undersigned Contractor agrees that the following nondiserimination commitment shall be made
a part of any contract which it may henceforth enter into with the City of South Bend, Indiana or any of its
agencies, boards or commissions.

Contractor agrees not to discriminate against or intimidate any employee or applicant for employment in the
performance of this contract with privileges of employment, or any matter directly or indirectly related to
employment, because of race, religion, color, sex, gender expression, gender identity, sexual orientation,
handicap, naticnal origin or ancestry. Breach of this provision may be regarded as material breach of
contract.

I, the undersigned bidder or agent as contracior on a public works project, understand my statutory
obligations to the use of steel products or foundry products made in the United States (I.C. 5-16-8-1). L hereby
certify that I and all subcontractors employed by me for this project will use steel products or foundry
products made in the United States on this project if awarded. I understand 1 have an affirmative duty to
notify the City in my bid that my proposal does not include the use of steel products or foundry products
made in the United States. T understand it is my scle obligation and responsibility to provide a justification
to the City, subject to review and approval, why the cost of United States made steel or foundry products is
unreasonable. Prior to award and upon submission of bid which does not use steel products or foundry
products made in the United States, the City, through its director of public works, shall make a determination
if the price of United States made steel or foundry is unreasonable, T understand that violations hereunder
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may result in forfeiture of contractual payments.

Aok ook
I hereby affirm under the penalties of perjury that the facts and information contained in the foregoing bid
for public works are true and correct.

Dated this 31st day of March , 2026

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc
o _,\ \ ,\‘ R “ f o, Contractor/Bidder (Firm)
A% '-:,' - .r"'.
0

SN . /
|(;..‘ C “_1’) ; f
s\ 2 '_(Q. Bl nature of Contractor/Bi
t ; 0] D Sn.;) " | ; .
LN = Jacob K. Kwilasz - Area Manager
[ Y Printed Name and Title
U, (O
’-"e‘:j. .‘(" ) Y\O v

4, "
Magupgerstd?

Subscribed and sworn to before me this _31st  day of March ,2026

My Commission Expires _February 10, 2034 Qly Prleeco

Notary Public

County of Residence Elkhart County, Indiana

“p 4, ALY MOORE
" = 2 Notary Public, State of Indiana
SEAL n- Elkhart County
t S Commission Number NPO768620
o M‘" My Commission Expires
""Hu s Febfuary 10,2034

rt No’,_’

AW,

\\\\
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'Y GCownstruction Go., Inc.

100% Quality » 100% Employee Owned « Over 100 Years

CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, that the undersigned President of Risth-Riley Construction Co., Inc., a corporation duly organized and existing
under the laws of the State of Indiana, hereby represents and confirms that Jacob K. Kwilasz, Area Manager, has full power and authority to make,
execute, seal, if required by law, and deliver for and on its behalf, and as its act and deed any and all bids, proposals or contracts, said bids, proposals or
contracts not to exceed $3,000,000.00 which bids, proposals or contracts call for work, services, or materlals to be furished by Rieth-Riley Construction
Co,, inc., whether such bids, proposals or contracts are being submitted to an individual or entity, public or private, and to bind Rieth-Riley Construction
Co., Inc. thereby as fully and to the same extent as if such bids, propesals or contracts were signed by an Executive Officer of Rieth-Riley Construction
Co., Inc., and sealed, if required by law, and attested by one of such officers, and hereby ratifies and confirms all that the above named designee may do
in pursuance hereof.

The authority granted to the above named designes Is pursuant to Section 6.03 of the Amended and Restated Code of By-Laws of Rieth-Riley Construction
Co., Inc., as amended, sffective April 26, 2019 (the "Restated By-Laws"), and which Restated By-Laws, as amended, and the authority granted to the
above named designee continue in full force and effect.

This Certificate of Authority is Issued, signed and sealed, if required by law, by facsimile under and by authority of the followlng standing resolutions
adopted by the Board of Directors of Rleth-Riley Censtruction Co., Inc., at a meeting held on the 16th day of February, 19986, at which a quorum was
present, and which resolutions have not been amended or repealed and continue In full force and effect:

‘Resolved that for purposes of clarification and in furtherance of the intent of Sectlon 6.03 of the By-Laws of the Company the authority
granfed in Section 6.03 shall extend fo the making, execution, sealing, Iif required by law, and delivery on behalf of the Company of
all documents required as part of any bid, proposal or contract, which is for work, services or maleriais to be furnished by Company
and which is being submiffed to an individual or entfty, public or private.”

“Resolved that in carrying out the provisions of Section 6.03 of the By-Laws of the Company the signatures of such directors and
officers and, if required by law, the seal of the Company may be affixed to any such Cerlfificate of Authority or any certificate relating
therefo by facsimile, and any such Certificate of Authority or certificate bearing such facsimile signatures or facsimile seal shail be
valid and binding upon the Company and any such Cerlificate of Authorify so executed and certified by facsimile signature and
facsimile seal shall be valid and binding upon the Coempany, with respect fo any bld, proposal or contract fo which it Is atfached.”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc., has caused these presents to be signed by its President and its corporate seal to be hereto

affixed, this 4" day of February, 2025.
RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

CEeEp

A. Keith Rose, President

STATE CF INDIANA )
18S;
COUNTY OF ELKHART )

On this 4™ day of February, 2025, before me personally came A. Keith Rose, to me known, who, being by me sworn, did depose and say: that he is
Presidant of Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc., the corporation described in and which exacuted the above instrument; that he knows the seal of said
corporation; that the seal affixed to the sald instrument is such corporate seal; and that he executed the said instrument on behalf of the corporation by
authority of his office pursuant to corporation’s Restated By-Laws and standing resolutions.

My Commission Expires: May 16, 2027

A E&wf:@@&_

Tracl L Funderburk Nofary Public
Residing in Elkhart County, Indiana

I, Robert L. Konopinski, do hereby certify that | am the duly appointed and acting Secretary of Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc., a corporation duly
arganized, valtdly existing and in good standing under the laws of the State of Indiana; that the foregaing Certificate of Autherity has neither been amended
or rescinded and remains in full force and effect; and furthermore, that the Rastated By-Laws and standing resolutions of the corporation, as referred to
and set forth in this Certificate of Authority, continue in full force and effect. .

tin
Sw td Sealed at th orporate Oiffice of Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc., in the City of Goshen, State of Indiana. Dated this [Ll day of

0“‘“"‘%»
f@"’i’% Robert L. Konopinski, Secratary
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1 00% uaht' 1 OO%Empoyee Owned Yars

December 9, 2025

To Whom It May Concern:

For your review we have included references from Private firms that we have performed work for.
AM General Corporation

(574) 284-2728

South Bend International Airport
(574) 800-5836

ITR Concessions LLC
574-674-5836

University of Notre Dame
574-631-7356

P.O. Box 1775 » 25200 S.R. 23 - South Bend, IN 46634 Phone: (574) 268-8321 « www.rieth-riley.com




ILEY Construction Co.

100% Quahty -TOO%Employee Owned » Over 100 Years

List names and addresses of subcontractors that we have used in public works projects

In the last five years:

Roadsafe Traffic Systems V&R Trucking
3519 Harding Street 1845 North Elmer Street
Indianapolis, IN South Bend, N.
Traffic Marking Trucking

Hawk Enterprises C-Tech Corporation
1850 E. North Street 5300 W. 100 North
Crown Point, IN Boggstown, IN
Electric/Signage Guard Rail/Fencing
R&R Excavating

2010 Went Avenue

Mishawaka, IN

Dirt/ Excavating

P.O. Box 1775 « 25200 5.R. 23 - South Bend, IN 46634

Slusser’s Green Thumb

P.0. Box 33

Logansport, IN
Landscaping/Erosion Control

Acorn Landscaping, LLC.
3680 W, Sample Street
South Bend, IN
Landscaping

Phone: (574) 288-8321 » www.rieth-tiley.com




Contractor’s Financial Statement

A Corporation
0 A Co-partnership

submitted by _Ni€th-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

with principal office st 3020 Elkhart Road, P.O. Box 477, Goshen, IN 46527-0477

O AnIndividual

To
Condition at close of business January 3, 2026
Dollars Cis.
ASSETS

1. Cash: (a) On hand 0
{b) In bank 17 2171115 7
{c) Elsewhere 0
2. Notes receivable (a) Due within 90 days 0
(b} Due after 90 days 0
(c) Past due 0
3. Accounts receivable from completed contracts, exclusive of claims not approved for payment 4111 7]1 2

4. Sums earried on uncompleted contracts as shown by engineer’s or architect’s estimate
(a) Amount receivable after deducting retainage 7 olol1]86 7
(b) Retainage to date; due upon completion of contracts 2 4111011 7
5. Aeccounts receivable from sources other than construction confracts 0
6. Deposits for bids or other guarantees: (a) Recoverable within 90 days 0
(b) Recoverable after 90 days 0
7. Interest accrued on loans, securities, etc.  OTHER CURRENT ASSETS 2 53162 5
8. Real ostate: {a) Used for business purposes 7 6:0/9|2 8
(b) Not used for business purposes 0
9. Stocks and bonds: (a) Listed — present market value 0
(b) Unlisted -- present value [
10, Materials in stock not included in Item 4 (a) For uncompleted contract (present value) 0
(b) Other materials (present value) 8 315|713 0
11. Equipment, book value 11 9111414 7

12, Furniture and fixtures, book value
13. Other assets 15 314[(913 0
Total assets 71 8l6|7[2 1
LIABILITIES
1. Notes payable: (a) To banks regular 8|l0j813 3
(b) To baoks for certified checks 0
(e) To others for equipment obligations 0
(d) To others exclusive of equipment obligations 0
2, Accounts payable: {a) Not past due 4 51414]656 4
{b) Past due 0
3. Real estate encumbrances 0
4, Other liabitities 17 7|8(4]86 8
5. Reserves 0
6. Capital stock paid up: (a) Comumon 412186 0
(b} Common Treasury 9 914|568 6
(c) Preferred 0
(d) Preferred Accumulated Other Comprehensive Loss 21718696 7
7. Surplus {net worth) 39 019|184 3
Total liabilities 71 8161712 1
CONTINGENT LIABILITIES

1. Liability on notes receivable, discounted or sold 0
2. Liability on accounts receivable, pledged, assigned or sold 0
3. Liability as bondsman fi]
4. Liability as guarantor on contracts or on accounts of others ]
5. Other contingent liabilities o
Total contingent liabilities Y
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INDIANAPOLIS, IN January 13, 2028
TO

RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO,, INC, GOSHEN, IN

who has filed wih the Department a Contractor's Safenert of Expenence and Financlal Condition as
reuined under indiana Code 8-23-10, |s hereby qualified fo bid st any Depariment of Transportaton
letting I Clagses of Work and within the amount and ofher imliation of each clessification s listed
below, tor sLich perid 25 he uncompletedworls on hand from all sosrces does not exceed the Aggregsie
amourt, Clagsification references by name or symbol are In accordance with the definlions In the
Contractor's Statement of Experlance and Finandlal Condttion. This cerfificate supersedes any certificate
previously lssued, but le subjest fo revizlon or revenstion according to the law, f and when changes
In fhe financial condiion of the cortracting firm or other facts justify such revislon or revocation.

Valid January 05, 2026 Thru July 31, 2026
Aggregate Bidding Capaciiy:

0085 CLEAN AND SEAL CRACKS /JOINTS IN PCCP/HMA PYMT...ooooovvooreeeeevrernneerssssesone $10,000,000.00
0135 EARTH RETENTION SYSTEMS: GENERAL......oovoooeeeeoeeeeemsesssessssossessesesessssess s $10,000,000.00
0155 TEMPORARY EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL ; $10,000,000.00
0250 DRIVEN PILING e saesrecesssssessmncosersocemsenn $10,000,000.00
0333 SOUND BARRIER WALL INSTALLATION . $10,000,000.00
0400 WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT SYSTEMS $20,000,000.00 [ 2
A{A) CONCRETE PAVEMENT: GENERAL $99,899,999.00 X
B(A) ASPHALT PAVEMENT: W/INDOT CERTIFIED HMA PLANT $09,000,000.00 |z
C(A) HEAVY GRADING $99,000,000.00 (g
D(A} HIGHWAY OR RAILROAD BRIDGE OVER WATER $99,999,999.00
D{B) HIGHWAY OR RAILROAD BRINGE OVER HIGHWAY $99,999,999.00
D{C) HWY/RR BRIDGE REQ RR TRACK PROTECTION $99,999,099.00
E(C) BRIDGE DECK OVERLAY AND MINOR BRIDGE REPAIR $10,000,000.00
E(E) SMALL STRUCTURES AND DRAINAGE [TEMS . $10,000,000.00
E(F) SURFACE MASONRY AND MISCELLANEOUS CONCRETE . oovoveeerereeeeeeeenesesesesseene $09,999,999.00
E(H) DEEP SEWER AND/OR EXCAVATION $99,999,999.00
E(R ) ASPHALT PAVEMENT MILLING $99,099,999,00
E(T) DEMOLITION $99,999,999.00
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CERTIFICATE OF QUALIFICATION
to provide
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
for
PUBLIC WORKS PROJECTS
to the
STATE OF INDIANA

This Certification Board, having duly considered application for qualification in terms of apparent experience and financial
rescurces; and under the applicable Indiana Code 4-13.6-4 and adopted rules of this Board, hereby issues a
Certificate of Qualification to provide construction services to the State of Indiana for Public Works Projects to:

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc.

3626 Elkhart Road

PO Box 477
Goshen, IN 46526
Phene (574) 875-5183
Fax

company Official  Michael J. Weber, CFO/Treasurer

for the twenty-seven month period stated herein, unless reveked by this Board for cause,
and in the classifications of services stated below, This certificate supercedes any previous certificate,

1611.01 Concrete Construction of Roads & Curbing - No Restrictions
1611.02 Asphalt Construction of Roads and Parking Lots - No
Restrictions

1622.01 Gen Contr-brdgs,vdcts,elvd hwys,riwy,tnls - No Restrictions
1623.03 Sewers and/or Water Lines - No Restrictions

1771.01 Concrete Construction - No Restrictions

1794.01 Earthmoving and Land Clearing - No Restrictions

1794.02 Excavation - No Restrictions

1795.02 Demolition of Pavements and Roads - No Restrictions

CERTIFICATION DATE (09-11-2024 EXPIRATION DATE 2026-12-11 12:00:00 AM

THIS CERTIFICATE ISSUED BY THE STATI: OF INDIANA, PUBLIC WORKS DIVISION CERTIFICATION BROARD,
402 WEST WASHINGTON STREET, ROOM W457, INDIANAPOLIS, INDIANA 46204,
ALSO ACTS AS THE OIFICIAL NOTICE OF EXPIRATION.

O@Lmaf C/wm@o\(}w@«um

Laura Chamberlain, Delegate Secretary
Certification Board

DAPW PQ2 State Form 3983R Rev. 07/08




October 15, 2025
CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Referenca: 401, 402, 410 & SM Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA
Producer
ITM 583 SM Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600

A certified hot mix asphalt producer is one who has complied with the requirements
set out in the above referenced specification. A producer accepted into this program may
supply asphalt mix for all projects beginning with the date approved as a certified hot
mix asphalt producer.

Source Producer Name
Code Location

3342 API CONSTRUCTION CCRP
HUNTERTOWN, IN

3390 APT CONSTRUCTION CORP
ANGOLA, IN

3321 ASPHALT SUPPLY CO.
SELLERSBURG, IN

3391  BABCOCK PAVING, INC
DEMOTTE, IN

3396 BARRETT PAVING MATERIALS, INC
CLEVES, OH

3560 BITUMEN SUPPLY, LLC (I)
CHARLESTOWN, IN

3303 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION CO INC
AUBURN, IN

3324 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION CO INC
FT WAYNE, IN

3360 BROOKS CONSTRUCTICN CO INC (I)
FT WAYNE, IN

3359 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION CO INC
HOAGLAND, IN

3372 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COC INC
MARION, IN

3291 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION CC INC (I}
WARSAW, IN

03536 BROOKS CONSTRUCTION CO INC
WARSAW, IN

3220 CALCAR PAVING, INC
PAOLI, IN

3119 CENTRAT, PAVING
LOGANSPORT, IN
lof7
Comments
(I} = Inactive




October 15, 2025

CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 &

ITM 583

3407

3393

3377

3192

3344

3546

3326

03564

32856

3373

3349

3387

3375

3355

3340

3279

3366

Comments
(1} = Inactive

C & R CONSTRUCTION
CORYDON, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
FLATROCK, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
HAYDEN, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
LEXINGTON, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
NEW POINT, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
ST, PAUL, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
VERSAILLES, IN

DAVE O'MARA CONTRACTORS
DERBYSHIRE, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
ANGOLA, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
BLOOMINGTON, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
CHANDLER, 1IN

E & B PAVING, LLC
CORYDON, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
FT WAYNE, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
HUNTINGTON, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
INDIANAPOLIS, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
PLYMOUTH, IN

E & B PAVING LLC
KOKOMO, IN

INC

INC

INC

INC

INC

INC

INC

SM Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA

SM Material Coda:

20of 7

Producer
401M34500 to 410M34600




October 15, 2025
CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRCDUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 & 8M Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA :
Producer ;
ITM 583 SM Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600 i

3348 E & B PAVING, LLC
CLAYTON, IN

3368 E & B PAVING LLC
MUNCIE, IN

3246 E & B PAVING LLC
NOBLESVILLE, IN -~ SR 38

333¢ E & B PAVING LLC
NOBLESVILLE, IN — RIVER RD

3287 E & B PAVING LLC
PENDLETON, IN

3302 E & B PAVING LLC
PERU, IN

3389 E & B PAVING, LLC (I)
ROCKPORT, IN

3298

=

& B PAVING, LLC
SELLERSBURG, IN

3341 E & B PAVING, LLC
WASHINGTON, IN

3371 GALLAGHER ASPHALT CORP,,
THORNTON, IL

3196  GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC ;
WABASH, IN |

3367  GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION INC (I)
DALE, IN

03563 HALL CONTRACTING OF KENTUCKY, INC.
LOUISVILLE, KY

3145 HOWARD MATERIALS, LLC
INDIANAPOLIS, IN

3404 HOWARD MATERIALS, LLC
INDIANAPOLIS, IN (TIBBS AVE.)

3383  HOT MIX INC
GREENSBURG, IN

3of7
Comments
(I) = Inactive



October 15, 2025

CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 &

SM Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA
Producer

SM Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600

INC

HARDING ST (PLANT #11)

4of7

IT™ 583

3550 JENSTAR ASPHALT LLC
GARY, IN

3403 JERRY DAVID ENTERPRISES, INC
EVANSVILLE, IN

3405 JH RUDOLPH & CO, INC
DALE, IN

3378 JH RUDOLPH & CO INC
ENGLISH, IN

3308 JH RUDOLPH & CO INC
EVANSVILLE, IN

3555 LOUSIVILLE PAVING CO
CRESTWOOD, KY

3398 LOUSIVILLE PAVING CO
LOUISVILLE, KY

3384 MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATION,
JEFFERSONVILLE, IN

3249 METZGER CONSTRUCTION CO INC
BOONVILLE, IN

3251 METZGER CONSTRUCTION CO INC
BOONVILLE, IN

3332 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
ELOOMFIELD, IN

3232 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP (I)
CAMBRIDGE CITY, IN

3315 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
COLUMBUS, IN

3397 MILESTONE COMNTRACTORS LP
DALEVILLE, IN

3309 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP (I)
DECATUR, IN

3304 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
INDIANAPOLIS, IN -

3317 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
INDIANAPOLIS, IN — 96T g7

Comments

{I) =Inactive




Cctober 15, 2025
CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 & 8M Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA
Producer
ITM 583 SM Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600

3323 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
LAFAYETTE, IN

3347 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
PLAINFIEID, IN

3345 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP (I}
PORTLAND, IN

3248 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
RICHMOND, IN

3333 MILESTONE CONTRACTCRS LP
VEEDERSBURG, IN

3363 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP
WHITESTOWN, IN

3336 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS, INC
GRIFFITH, IN

3388 MILESTCNE CONTRACTORS, INC
LOWELL, IN

3351 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS, INC
SCUTH BEND, IN

3382 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS, INC
VALPARAISO, IN

03562 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS, INC
KIMMEL, IN

3392 MILESTONE CONTRACTORS SOUTH, INC
CLOVERDALE, IN

3350 MILESTONE CONTRACTCORS SOUTH, INC
TERRE HAUTE, IN

3334 NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC
BRISTOL, IN

3137 PHEND & BROWN INC
DISKO, IN

3171 PHEND & BROWN INC
LEESBURG, IN

03561 PULVER ASPHALT PAVING INC
ALBION, IN

50f7
Comments
() =Inactive




Octobar 15, 2025
CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 & SM Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA
Producer
IT™™ 583 SM Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600

3399 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
RICHMOND, IN

3395 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CC INC (I)
DANVILLE, IN

3173 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
ELKHART, IN

3353 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
GARY, IN

3511 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC (I}
HOWE, IN

3330 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTICN CO INC
INDIANAPOLIS, IN - KY AVE “B”

3184 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC i
INDIANAPOLIS, IN - KY AVE “A”

3316 RIETH-RILEY CCONSTRUCTION CO INC
INDIANAPCLIS, IN - O™ gm

3386 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
LAFAYETTE, IN

3365 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
LAPORTE, IN

3300 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CC INC |
NOBLESVILLE, IN — (RIVER AVE) :

3290 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC
SQUTH BEND, IN

3379 RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CC INC
VALPARATSO, IN

3288 TEMPLE & TEMPLE PAVING
SALEM, IN

3154 TRI-COUNTY ASPHATLT
OTWELL, IN

3534 VALLEY ASPHALT CORP
CLEVES, OH

6 of 7
Comments
() =Inactive



Cctober 15, 2025
CERTIFIED HOT MIX ASPHALT PRODUCERS

Specification Reference: 401, 402, 410 & S8M Producer/Supplier Type: Certified HMA
Producer
IT™ 583 S8M Material Code: 401M34500 to 410M34600

3510 VALLEY ASPHALT CORP (I)
ROSS, OH

03535 VALLEY ASPHALT CORP
MCORRISTOWN, IN

3543 WALLS MANUFACTURING CO (I)
BROOKVILLE, OH

3544 WALLS MANUFACTURING CO (I}
GREENVILLE, OH

3343 WAYNE ASPHALT AND CCONST. CO INC
FORT WAYNE, IN

Tof7
Comments
(I) = Inactive




